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Exhibit 1B 11.13.2025
Bid Package #001: Demolition
Contractor 8td Bond ddendum #1 Addendum 02 Alternate €8 Plane Altemate R""'Z:n“l::" Gp Base Bld
Johler Demalition X ] X s 3,950.00 H 157,420.00
Alpine Demalition X X X 5 172,300.00
MIdwestWr!rJdng X X X $ 8,800.00 | § 208,240.00
Bid Package #002: Aquatics
Contractor 8id Bond Addendum 21 Addendum 92 Addendum 23 AR " Base Bid
Maverick Poalsinc X X X x $ 203945800
Schaefges Brothers, Inc X X X X 5 (4,660.00)| $ 2,048,000.00
Stuckey Canstruction X X X X § (7,000.00}f § 2,581,900.00
Bid Package #003: General Trades
Contractor Bid Bond g a Addendum 82 Altemate 82 ! Mtematess | Aemate 4 [ Base Bid
Hargrave Bulders X X X 5 (6500000 § 1400000 § s
W.8. Olsan, Inc. x X X $ :51,11uuo:l $ (10,530.00)' $ (3,000.00 $ 862.317.00
Edwin “"""‘:;'ic““‘““““’“ X X X s (1n1.sau,nn|| s na,anu.ouzl 5 116.800.00){ § 965,000.00
Flidm Eatiw S o ot X X X 5 nm,suo.nual 5 uumw:' $ nzoooom| § 111800000
Bid Package #004: Fire Protection
T Bld Bond Addendum 11 ‘Addendum #2 Base BId
Ve S Mhaemn e NIA X x 5 16,525.00
Nelsan Fire Protection X X X $ 2101600
Automatic Fire Systems, Inc. No Bid
v:u-sy ‘Z'm’,f“&‘c“"‘" NoBid
id Package #005: Plumbing
Cofitractor Bid Band Addendum #1 Addendum #2 Alternate #5 | [T Base Bid
Ernie Peterson Plumbing, Inc. X X X s {3,900.00) $ 182,000.00
DeFranca Plumbing, Inc X X X H 3,107.00 $ 203,653.00
Martin Petsen Copar: X X X s t4.300.00) § (5,700.001] § 28145000
AEBH Plumbing NoBld
Bid Package #006: HVAC
Contractar §id Bond Addendum 81 Addendum 82 Base Bid
Amber Mechanical X X X s 434,400.00
Ancher Mechanieal No Bid
F.E. Moran, Inc. No Bid
FloTech Mec:':lnml Systems NoBid
Westside Mechanical No Bid
Bid Package #007: Electrical
Contractor 5d Bond Addendum 81 Addendum 82 A [ Mtemate#4 | Alternateds | Alematedt | Basedid
Lyans Electric Company, Inc. X X X s 26,900.00 | § (0020 $ 0 .muml s {1,450.00)| § 530,600.00
Kelso-Burnett Co. X X X $ 35.750.00| § (95000} $ (650.00)f § 2,05000 | § 695,500.00
Carey Electric Contracting LLC No Bid
Public Electric Construction No Bid
Bid Package #008: Painting
Contractor Bid Bond Addendum 81 Addendum #2 Altemnate 82| Alernated3 | Alternated? | Base Bid
Cosgrove Construction x x X $ {2,00000}| $ @ooao| m.ouml B 112,000.00
Ascher Brothers Co. Inc. X X X 5 (7,000 ﬂ!)‘.\E 5 151,500.00
Qosterbaan & Sons Painting % X X 5 ns.ooonmls 157,650.00
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Bid Package #009: Glass & Glazing

11.13.2025

Contractor Bid Bond Addendum #1 Addendum #2 Alternate #6 Base B
Winets "."""‘:‘T"u'lca"‘“ X X x 5 Ge600|$ 20996500
Lake Shore Glass X X X $ 1,700.00 | § 239,000.00
Des Plaines Glass No Bid
Bld Package #010: Structural Steel and Misc. Metals
Contractar Bid Bond ddendum £1 Addendum §2 Base Bid
Ralph H. Simpsan Company X X X 3 21620000
Composite Steel No Bid
Regal Steel Group No Bid
Bid Package #011: Masonry
C Bid Bond Addendum 81 dum 82 Base Bid
Jimmy's Masonry X X x [] 86,300.00
JAC Masanry Inc. X X X $ 87,750.00
Midwest Masanry, Inc X X X $ 69,600.00
A-One Graup, Ltd. X X X H 119,000.00
NaBid

Rasco Masanry, Inc




